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Fee Filer

ain Meny | Report for Auto-Add Fees

Logged in as: Adelman Communications (0006835722) [Log Out]

Licensee Name

il

DETAIL REPORT FOR AUTO-ADD FEES

Fiscal Fee

IF(:C |
Code 1 FCC Code 2

Number

ADELMAN , | l | ‘
BRAODCASTING INC 2013 WPOP540] 1369 $10.00

ADELMAN

BROADCASTING, 2013 WLP921 1369 $10.00

INC.

ADELMAN

BROADCASTING, 2013 WLIZ?76 1369)| 1 $10. DD 30158

INC.

ADELMAN

BROADCASTING WQCSSe53 $10.00 84860

INC.

ADELMAN CA

IB:gADCAS‘I’ING 1342 $1,500.00}| 84860 OHANNESBURG
ADELMAN

BROADCASTING, 2013 WPMJI961 [ 1369([ 1

INC.

ADELMAN

BROADCASTING, 2013 KGBB 13415 1 $750.00 CA EDWARDS

INC.

ADELMAN CA

}BSSADCASTING, 2013 KEPD 1342 $1,500.00 RIDGECREST
RORDCA - I - ﬂ -
BROADCASTING, 2013 KLOA 1330 $900.00 N/A
INC. RIDGECREST
ADELMAN CA

IB“I;!;:(:)MDCMSTING, 2013 KWD) 1336 $1,000.00) 30157 RIDGECREST N/A
ADELMAN

IB“lll((:JADCAS'I'ING, 2013 1342 1 $1,500 30158 RIDGECREST N/A

Now displaying records 1 to 11 of 11.
Customer Service
ty Asked Fee Filer Hel Filing & Web Policies /
Questions Privacy Policy Act

Financial Operations Help Desk: (877) 480-3201, option 4 (Mon.-Fri. 8 a.m.-6:00 p.m. ET)
https://apps.foc.govFeeFilerireport_prefilled_fees.clim?year=2013&frm=00068357228senice=2
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Customar Sarvice
Erequently Asked Fee Filer Help Eiling Resoyrces Web Policigs / Paperwork Reduction
Questions Privagy Poficy Act
Financial Operations Help Desk: (877) 480-3201, option 4 (Mon.-Frl. 8 a.m.-6:00 p.m, ET)

Fee Filer has a dedicated staff of customer service representatives standing by to answer your guestions or
. concerns.

You can emall us at aringuiries@fcc.gov.

it fappe. foc.g ovF eeF iler freport cimvemit _id=238234080rigin=R
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Fee Filer

Report for Submitted Fees

| Reprt for Submitted Fees

Report Date : 09/19/2013 07:11:34

« The FCC has not yet received payment for the fees reflected in this report. Click here to

« If paying regulatory fees by check, money order, credit card by mail or fax, or through a wire
transfer from your bank to the FCC lockbox bank, proceed to the Payment Summary page to
view and print the Form 159-E Remittance Voucher. All payments must include the Form 159-
E Remittance Voucher generated by Fee Filer, which includes the voucher number associated

with your transaction.

Payer FRN : 0006835722 Payer Name :Adelman Communications -

Voucher # : E002392340
At $7,200.00 ;;‘;‘3‘:"‘ $0.00
Agency Payment
Tracking V":'e
1D: Date:
Licensee : ADELMAN BROADCASTING, INC. (FRN: 0006835722)
Cali Sign |P TC | Quantity | FCC Code 1 | FCC Code 2 Bill Number | Amount Lt
KLOA 1330 1]459 CA RIDGECREST N/A £900.00| $0.00
KWD] 1336 1}30157 CA RIDGECREST N/A $1,000.00| $0.00
KGBB 1341 1457 CA EDWARDS N/A $750.00| $0.00
KEPD 1342 11458 CA RIDGECREST N/A $1,500.00] $0.00

CA

KRAJ 1342 1184860 JOHANNESBURG N/A $1,500.00]| $0.00
KZ1Q-FM 1342 1]30158 CA RIDGECREST N/A $1,500.00 ¢$0'00
WLI776 1369 1130158 N/A $10.001 $0.00
WLP921 1369 1457 N/A $10.00 $0.00
WPMJ961 | 1369 1]|457 N/A $10.00| $0.00
WPOP540] 1369 1 N/A $10.00| $0.00
WQCS953 ] 1369 1]84860 N/A $10.00] $0.00
Tml: 2 2 KOk 11 o 3 3 3k A Ak ok 2 e o A o A A e o o A o ok e K $7,200.00 $°.oo

hitpe:fapps. foc. gowF eeFlerfreport chmremit_id=23823408arigin=R
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Print

Subject: Fw: Adelman Part 74 license issues still to be resolved

From: Chris Compton {(chris@kfxm.com)

To: colleenwardlaw@yahoo.com;

Date: Monday, January 13, 2014 4:43 PM

— Original Message —
From: Howard Fine
To: 'Chris Compton' ;

mail.

Sent: Sunday, January 05, 2014 6:05 AM
Subject: Adelman Part 74 license issues still to be resolved

We still need to clean up a few items with these stations.
There is a bad licensee name for KLOA-FM. The licensee name is ADELMAN BRAQDCASTING
INC. The STL WPOP540 is not correctly associated with the station..
There is no license for a STL for KEPD-FM.

Call Sign

Licensee

ADELMAN
BRAODCASTING INC

ADELMAN

RIDGECREST ,
CA

ADELMAN
BROADCASTING, INC.

EDWARDS , CA

ADELMAN
BROADCASTING, INC.

JOHANNESBURG
, CA

RIDGECREST,
CA

Licensee

Frequency -
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Logged in as: Adelman Communications (0006835722) [Log Qut]
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Fee Filer

Regulatory Fee Manager

ain Meny | Regulatory Fee Manager

| Saved Fees Summary |

Filing & Payment History

Pay
Filing Date Online/Print
Voucher # Payer FRN Amt Submitted Status Details Form 159
E002392340 0006835722 $7,200.00 ScP19-  Awaiting i\, continue  Unsubmit
d ’ 2013 Payment
Nov-13- View
E002230609 0006835722 $2,968.75 Paid View Payment  -——-—-—
2012 Receipt
Sep_13_ m
E002199988 0006835722 $4,450.00 5.1 Paid View Payment -
Receipt
Sep-14- View
E002006387 0006835722 $5,025.00 Paid Yiew Payment S
2011
Sep-18- View
E001044367 0013793203 $4,500.00 Paid Yiew Paymemt -
2006 Recalpt
Customer Service
fregyently Asked Feg Filer Help Filing Resoyrces Web Policies / Paperwork Reduction
Questions Privacy Policy Act

Financial Operations Help Desk: (877) 480-3203, option 4 {(Mon.-Fri. 8 a.m.-6:00 p.m. ET)

Fee Filer has a dedicated staff of customer service representatives standing by te answer your questions or
concerns.

You can email us at gringuiries@fcc,.gov.

.gouFesFiler/regfess_manageri.cim
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[Your request could not be completed:

Online Payment

= To complete this transaction, please indicate your acceptance of the Authorization and Disclosure agreement by selecting
the designated checkbox.

Step 2: Authorize Payment

11213

Payment Summary  Editthis information
Address information || Account Information Payment Information Il
Account Holdol.' Robert Adelman Card Type: American Express Payment Amount: $7,200.00
Name: Card Number: 6001 Transaction Date 09/19/2013 19:23]
731 N. Balsam and Time: EDT :
Bllling Address: St ‘
Bllling Address 2:
City: Ridgecrest i

State / Province: CA
Zp / Postal Coda: 93555
Country: USA
Emaill Confirmation Recaipt

* : To have a confirmation sent to you upon completion of this transaction, provide an email address and confirmation below.

Email Address: !coﬂeenwardlaw@yahoo.com

l

Confirm Emall Address: fcolleenwardlaw@yahoo.oom

|

cC:

Separate muiliple email addresses with a
y comma

Authorization and Disclosure

Roqulrod ﬁelds are Indlcahd with a red amrld(

I authonza a charge to my . card account for the above amount |n accordance w1th my card issuer agraament . *

Press the "Submit Payment™ Button only once. Pressmg the button more than once could resutt in multipte tmnsactlons

Note: Please avoid navlgatfng the site ustng your browser's Back Button - this may lead to Incornplete data being transmitted
and pages being Ioadod lncomactly Please use the links pmded whenevar posmbla

hitpes:/Awww. pary. g ovpayg ovpaymants/authori zePlasti cC ardPaymant. html

"
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Online Payment
Step 3: Confirm Payment _ 1123

Thank you.
Your transaction has been successfully completed.

Pay.gov Tracking Information
Application Name: Remittance Advice
Pay.gov Tracking ID: 25CESDKJ
Agency Tracking ID: PGC2392340
Transaction Date and Time: 09/19/2013 19:24 EDT

. Payment Summary
' Address Information /| Account Information || Payment Information |
Account Holdea: Robert Adelman Card Type: American Express Payment Amount: $7,200.00 _
Name: Card Number: 6001 Transaction Date 09/19/2013 19:24;
731 N. Balsam and Time: EDT ;

Billing Address: St
Billing Address 2:
Clty: Ridgecrest
State / Province: CA
dp | Postal Code: 93555
Country: USA

hitps /Awww. pay.g owpeyg ovpeyments/authorizePl asticCardPaymant himi "
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Electronic Form 159

FEDERAL COMMUNICATIONS COMMISSION

Online Payment Receipt
PAID: 9/19/2013

Transaction Summary

Lockbox Number:  FCC Voucher Number: Payer FRN: Total Amount Paid:
979084 E002392340 0006835722 $7,200.00 US Dollars
Payer Information

Adelman Communications
731 N. Balsam St
Ridgecrest, CA 93555
Phone: 760-3711700

Applicant Information

APPLICANT 1:

ADELMAN BRACDCASTING INC
731 N. Balsam St

Ridgecrest, CA 93555
Phone:760-3711700

FRN: 0006835722

APPLICANT 2:

ADELMAN BROADCASTING, INC.
731 N, Balsam 5t

Ridgecrest, CA 93555
Phone:760-3711700

FRN: 0006835722

lick h r full details of i

Authorization Information

Successfui Authorization

Authorization Number: 240413

Authorization Date/Time: 9/19/2013 7:24 PM
Agency Tracking ID: PGC2392340

hitps.//pay.foc.govElectronicFormiSa/success_159_himl/printed159E_success.cfm
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FILE COPY ONLYI

Customer Service

£QC Fees Web Policies / Privacy ECC Home Page

If you have any questions or concerns please contact your licensing system help desk.

hitpeipey.foc.govElectranicF orm15a/success_158_himifprinted159E_success. cim
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Electronic Form 159

FEDERAL COMMUNICATIONS COMMISSION
Online Payment Receipt
PAID: 9/19/2013

Transaction Summary

Lockbox Number:  FCC Voucher Number: Payer FRN: Total Amount Paid:
979084 ED02392340 0006835722 $7,200.00 US Dollars

Payer Information

Adelman Communications
731 N. Balsam St
Ridgecrest, CA 93555
Phone: 760-3711700

Applicant Information

APPLICANT 1:

ADELMAN BRAODCASTING INC
731 N. Balsam St

Ridgecrest, CA 93555
Phone:760-3711700

FRN: 0006835722

APPLICANT 2:

ADELMAN BROADCASTING, INC.
731 N, Balsam 5t

Ridgecrest, CA 93555
Phone:760-3711700

FRN: 0006835722

lick h r iis of

Authorization Information

Successful Authorization

Authorization Number: 240413

Authorization Date/Time: 9/19/2013 7:24 PM
Agency Tracking ID: PGC2392340

https./fpay.foc.govBlectronicFormiS@isuccess_158_himi/printed159E_success.cim



W13 AP R U L 8 R i

FILE COPY ONLYI

Customer Service

FCG Fees Web Policies / Privacy ECC Home Page

If you have any questions or concerns piease contact your licensing system help desk.

hitps //pay.fec.govElectronicForm159/success._158_himl/printed159E._success.cfim
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_* Fee Fller has a dedicated staff of customer service representatives standing by to answer your questioris or
concerns.
» You can email us at gringuiries@¥fcc.goy.

Htpsiapps. foc.g o eaFileriraport_prefilled_fees cfim?year=20138frm=00068357228senice=2



